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ATCHAFALAYA BASIN LEVEE DISTRICT
P. O. Box 170

Port Allen, Louisiana 70767-0170

Phone (225) 387-2249

Fax     (225) 387-4742






      June 6, 2018





A Regular Board Meeting of the Board of Commissioners for the Atchafalaya Basin Levee District was held at the Office of the Board in Port Allen, Louisiana at 4:00 pm, Wednesday, 
June 6, 2018.  President John Grezaffi called the meeting to order.  President John Grezaffi declared a quorum present, and Mrs. Janice Jarreau called the roll.  The following members were present:

COMMISSIONER


PARISH

Glenn Angelle


Iberia

Bill Flynn



West Baton Rouge
Kenneth Gordon


West Baton Rouge

John Grezaffi


Pointe Coupee 
Spencer Harvey


Ascension

Karen Jewell


Iberville

Moise LeBlanc


St. Martin



Harry Marionneaux


Iberville 
Absent: 

Daniel Hebert


Iberville

Earl Matherne


Assumption

Jody Meche



St. Martin
Nickie Rockforte


Pointe Coupee

Also Present:

INDIVIDUAL


REPRESENTING


Cecil Tessier


Assistant Executive Director

William Tyson


Executive Director

Nicholas Rockforte


Levee Board Attorney

Janice Jarreau


Administrative Program Manager
Tiffany Weber


Administrative Program Specialist
Crissi Canezaro


Administrative Program Specialist
Kristy Jewell


Human Resource Analyst

                                                                    * * * * *
President Grezaffi asked for public comments.  Hearing none, he proceeded with the Agenda.     

                                                                    * * * * *

After review of the Minutes of May 2, 2018 meeting, Commissioner Glenn Angelle moved, seconded by Commissioner Karen Jewell and unanimously carried to approve the minutes as presented and to publish the minutes in the official journal.
                                                                    * * * * *
Commissioner Karen Jewell moved, seconded by Commissioner Kenneth Gordon and unanimously carried to approve a right of entry request for soil boring on the Mississippi River Levee by the Corps of Engineers.  

Mr. Will Tyson shared the content of an email he received from Mr. David Cavell of Congressman Garret Graves office as a follow up on the Old River meeting.  He said the Congressman had a few follow up meetings with the Corps and the state after their last meeting in Baton Rouge.  Congressman Graves’ staff is now working on adding a provision to the Water Resources Development Act to direct the Corps to update the operations of the Old River Control Structure. He said there was some back and forth between the Corps and the State on the study discussed.  Mr. Tyson said we are hoping to get the funding to complete this work.  

                                                                    * * * * *
The CPRA representative was unable to attend the meeting due to traffic.

                                                                    * * * * *
                                                                  NOTICE

Sealed bids will be received by the Board of Commissioners, Atchafalaya Basin 

Levee District, in its Office in Port Allen, Louisiana, up to 2:00 p.m., Wednesday, June 6, 2018 

and can also be submitted online at www.centralauctionhouse.com for:

(1)

Furnishing Gasoline and Diesel Fuel delivered at designated locations

within the District in quantities as requested for twelve calendar months

beginning July 1, 2018 and ending June 30, 2019.

(2)

Furnishing Crushed Limestone delivered at designated locations within the District in quantities as requested for twelve calendar months beginning July 1, 2018 and ending June 30, 2019.

All bids will be publicly opened and read at 4:00 p.m. of the same day, and any bid

received after 2:00 p.m. will be returned unopened.

The right is reserved to reject any and all bids and to waive informalities.

Bid to be submitted in sealed envelope marked





 “BID – FUEL” or “BID - AGGREGATES.”
Specifications, proposal forms, etc., are available at the Atchafalaya Basin Levee 

District Office, (525 Court Street) P. O. Box 170, Port Allen, Louisiana 70767, telephone

number (225) 387-2249.

Janice G. Jarreau





John Grezaffi

Secretary






            President
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Daily Journal of Commerce, The Advocate, Plaquemine Post South, and Pointe Coupee Banner

May 3, 10, and 17, 2018

INSERT BIDS

 SEQ CHAPTER \h \r 1ATCHAFALAYA BASIN LEVEE DISTRICT

TABULATION OF BIDS

Wednesday, June 6, 2018

DESCRIPTION
	Name of Bidder
	Acadiana

Shell


	Moreau’s 

Material 

Yard
	Luhr Bros.
	Slats Lucas

Aggregates
	
	
	

	ITEM #1

Crushed 

Limestone (#57)
	Amount per ton

$ 34.90
	Amount per ton

$ 31.40


	Amount per ton

$ 35.50


	Amount per ton

No Bid


	Amount per ton


	Amount per ton


	Amount per ton

	ITEM #2

Crushed Limestone(#57)


	Amount per ton

No Bid
	Amount per ton

No Bid


	Amount per ton

No Bid


	Amount per ton

$ 25.25


	Amount per ton


	Amount per ton


	Amount per ton

	ITEM #3

Crushed Limestone(#57)
	Amount per ton

No Bid
	Amount per ton

No Bid


	Amount per ton

$ 26.50


	Amount per ton

No Bid


	Amount per ton


	Amount per ton


	Amount per ton

	ITEM #4

Crushed Limestone (#57)
	Amount per ton

$ 35.00
	Amount per ton

$ 40.00
	Amount per ton

$ 38.50
	Amount per ton

No Bid
	Amount per ton


	Amount per ton


	Amount per ton

	ITEM #5

Crushed Limestone (#57)
	Amount per ton

$ 46.20


	Amount per ton

No Bid
	Amount per ton

$ 44.50
	Amount per ton

$ 47.00
	Amount per ton


	Amount per ton


	Amount per ton

	ITEM #6

Crushed Limestone (#57)
	Amount per ton

$ 41.20
	Amount per ton

No Bid


	Amount per ton

 $ 38.50


	Amount per ton

32.00


	Amount per ton


	Amount per ton


	Amount per ton

	ITEM #7

Crushed Limestone (#57)
	Amount per ton

$ 37.80
	Amount per ton

No Bid


	Amount per ton

$ 39.50


	Amount per ton

No Bid


	Amount per ton


	Amount per ton


	Amount per ton

	ITEM #8

Crushed Limestone (#57)
	Amount per ton

$ 38.90
	Amount per ton

$ 37.00


	Amount per ton

$ 38.50


	Amount per ton

No Bid


	Amount per ton


	Amount per ton


	Amount per ton

	ITEM #9

Crushed Limestone (#57)
	Amount per ton

$ 41.00
	Amount per ton

$ 36.00


	Amount per ton

$ 38.50


	Amount per ton

No Bid


	Amount per ton


	Amount per ton


	Amount per ton

	ITEM #10

Crushed Limestone (#57)
	Amount per ton

 $ 40.70
	Amount per ton

No Bid


	Amount per ton

$ 38.50


	Amount per ton

$ 35.00


	Amount per ton


	Amount per ton


	Amount per ton

	ITEM #11

Crushed Limestone (#57)
	Amount per ton

$ 38.40
	Amount per ton

$ 39.00
	Amount per ton

$ 40.50
	Amount per ton

No Bid
	Amount per ton


	Amount per ton


	Amount per ton

	ITEM # 12

Crushed 

Limestone (#610)
	Amount per ton

No Bid
	Amount per ton

No Bid
	Amount per ton

No Bid
	Amount per ton

$ 24.25
	Amount per ton


	Amount per ton


	Amount per ton

	ITEM #13

Crushed 

Limestone (#610)
	Amount per ton

No Bid
	Amount per ton

No Bid
	Amount per ton

$ 22.50
	Amount per ton

No Bid
	Amount per ton


	Amount per ton


	Amount per ton


Commissioner Karen Jewell moved, seconded by Commissioner _____________ and unanimously carried to take the bids under advisement.

ADVERTISEMENT FOR BIDS

OFFICIAL JOURNAL


Sealed bids will be received by the Board of Commissioners for the Atchafalaya Basin Levee District, at 525 Court Street, Port Allen, Louisiana, up to 2:00 p.m., Wednesday, June  6, 2018, for printing and publication of minutes of meetings of the Atchafalaya Basin Levee District and all other legal advertisements required by law for a period of one (1) year.  


All bids will be publicly opened and read at 4:00 p.m. of the same day, and any bid received subsequent to 2:00 p.m. will be returned unopened.


The right is reserved to reject any and all bids and to waive informalities.


Bid to be submitted in sealed envelope marked “BID - OFFICIAL JOURNAL.”

Janice G. Jarreau




 John Grezaffi

Secretary





 President

3t

Pointe Coupee Banner, Plaquemine Post South and West Side Journal

May 3, 10 and 17, 2018.

The Pointe Coupee Banner bid $2.90 per square inch.  Commissioner Kenneth Gordon moved, seconded by Commissioner Harry Marionneaux and unanimously carried to award the bid to the only bidder.

                                                                    * * * * *
A meeting of the Insurance/Finance Committee of the Board of Commissioners for the Atchafalaya Basin Levee District was held at 4:00 p.m., Wednesday, May 23, 2018, at the Board Office in Port Allen, Louisiana.  Chairman Daniel Hebert called the meeting to order.  

The following members were present:

Daniel Hebert, Chairman 

Earl Matherne, 1st Vice Chairman

Moise LeBlanc, Member

Karen Jewell, Member

Bill Flynn, Ex-Officio Chairman

John Grezaffi, Ex-Officio Chairman

Absent:  None

Also Present:

Commissioner Glenn Angelle

Commissioner Harry Marionneaux

Commissioner Kenneth Gordon

Commissioner Spencer Harvey

Rob Furman, Levee Board Auditor

Nicholas Rockforte, Levee Board Attorney

William Tyson, Executive Director

Cecil Tessier, Assistant Executive Director

Richard Sparks, Levee Board Operations Superintendent
Janice Jarreau, Administrative Program Manager

Crissi Canezaro, Administrative Program Specialist

Tiffany Weber, Administrative Program Specialist

Kristy Jewell, Human Resource Analyst

1. Presentation of audit ending June 30, 2017 - Mr. Rob Furman presented a copy of the Independent Auditor’s Report for the period ending June 30, 2017.  Mr. Furman said it is a clean report with no adjustments to be made.  He said he only found one minor problem with the depreciation schedule.  Mr. Furman said our previous accountant was not maintaining the depreciation schedule as part of her year-end accounting procedures.  Mr. Furman is now working with the staff to correct this problem.  He said his experience working with the staff was extremely positive.

2. Amend 2017-2018 budget – Mr. Tyson advised the committee we must adjust the budget to remain within the 5% tolerance allowed by the legislative auditor.  After a review of the budget, Commissioner Kenneth Gordon moved, seconded by Commissioner Karen Jewell and unanimously carried to amend the 2017-2018 budget as presented.

3. Adopt 2018-2109 budget – Mr. Tyson advised the committee he prepares the budget based on numbers from last year’s budget, but we can amend it as needed.  After a brief discussion, a motion was made by Commissioner Moise LeBlanc, seconded by Commissioner Karen Jewell and unanimously carried to adopt the proposed 2018-2019 budget.

There being no further business to come before the committee, upon motion by Earl Matherne and unanimously carried the meeting adjourned.

Respectfully submitted,

/s/Daniel Hebert, Chairman


/s/Earl Matherne, 1st Vice Chairman

/s/Karen Jewell, Member


/s/Moise LeBlanc, Member





/s/Bill Flynn, Ex-Officio Chairman

/s/John Grezaffi, Ex-Officio Chairman

Mr. Will Tyson advised the board that our CPA made a presentation at the meeting on the results from our audit.  We had only one schedule that was not produced.  Accounting procedures will be changed to make that adjustment.  The committee also reviewed and approved changes to this year’s budget and amendments to next year’s budget.  Commissioner Karen Jewell moved, seconded by Commissioner Spencer Harvey and unanimously carried to approve the recommendations of the Insurance/Finance Committee in their minutes of their meeting on 

June 27, 2018.  
                                                                    * * * * *
Commissioner Harry Marionneaux moved, seconded by Commissioner Karen Jewell and unanimously carried to authorize the staff to obtain quotes for employee uniforms.

                                                                    * * * * *
Mr. Nicholas Rockforte advised the board that a court date of June 18th has been set in the matter of the bike path litigation in West Baton Rouge Parish.  He said we have three proposals pending, including two in West Baton Rouge Parish and one in White Castle.  We are currently drafting a cooperative endeavor agreement for the two later proposals, but we may need to wait until the court decision is made on this first litigation before moving further.  He said one of the proposers has asked that we include an assignment of our rights under the statute to them.  He said he does not have any problem with that, but if some court rule in the future it is not valid.  By including the assignment language in the cooperative endeavor agreements, it may prevent us from being drawn into future court cases.  Mr. Rockforte said he will bring the final documents to the board for approval.  
                                                                    * * * * *
Mr. Rockforte reported that Interstate Exploration, LLC has asked for a one-month extension of their lease to allow for delays caused by high water.  Moved by Commissioner Glenn Angelle, seconded by Commissioner Kenneth Gordon and unanimously carried to approve the one-month extension requested by Interstate Exploration, LLC.
                                                                    * * * * *
Mr. Tyson shared a communication from the Attorney General relative to legal training that is available through his office relative to public records law, Attorney General Opinions, etc.  This training is not required, but rather is being made available free of charge to state agencies.  

                                                                    * * * * *
There being no further business to come before the board, upon motion by Commissioner Moise LeBlanc and unanimously carried the meeting adjourned.
____________________________________           ____________________________________

Janice Jarreau, Secretary


           John Grezaffi, President

____________________________________

Linda Alwood, Contract Stenographer 
An Equal Opportunity Employer

